
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-14072
 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 21, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

9 ea. *

9,600 GVWR (minimum) single-rear wheel, two-wheel drive, extended cab truck with installed UNIT PRICE 38,845.00 39,327.00 44,350.43 43,591.61

service body, complete per specifications TOTAL 349,605.00 353,943.00 399,153.87 392,324.49

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F250 Supercab XZA  2015 Ford F250 Chev. CC25953 2015 Chev CC25953

A. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 150 days 105-135 days week of Spet 15, 2014 120-150 days

4 ea. *

9,900 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 extended cab, wide and long bed, single rear wheels pickup UNIT PRICE 34,940.00 34,913.00 39,908.66 39,699.61

truck with 1,300 liftgate, per specifications TOTAL 139,760.00 139,652.00 159,634.64 158,798.44

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F250 Supercab XZA w/liftgate 2015 Ford F250 Chev. CC25953 2015 Chev CC25953

B. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 90-120 days week of Spet 15, 2014 120 days

1 ea. *

9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) crew-ca/quad-cab UNIT PRICE 35,885.00 36,007.00 40,957.14 40,954.85

pickup truck, complete, per specifications TOTAL 35,885.00 36,007.00 40,957.14 40,954.85

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F250 4x4 crew cab SWB W2B 2015 Ford F250 Chev. CK25743 2015 Chev CK25743

C. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 90-120 days week of Spet 15, 2014 120 days

2 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum 4x4 wide and long type bed (no fender outside) extended, club, super- UNIT PRICE 26,780.00 26,515.00   

cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 53,560.00 53,030.00 NO BID  NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F150 4x4 Supercab LWB X1E 2014 Ford F150   

D. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 90-120 days   

1 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and long type bed ( no fender outside) extended, club, UNIT PRICE 28,115.00 27,605.00   

super-cab-pickup truck with tool boxes, per specifications TOTAL 28,115.00 27,605.00 NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F150 4x4 Supercab LWB X1E 2014 Ford F150    

E. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 90-120 days   

 *

1 ea. UNIT PRICE 27,885.00 28,061.00   

5,700 GVWR, 4x2, 4-door sport utility-type vehicle, per specifications TOTAL 27,885.00 28,061.00 NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford Explorer FWD K7B 2015 Ford Explorer   

F. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 90-120 days   

1 ea. *

19,000 GVWR (minimum) 83' CA, 42 regular-ca, cab-chassis with installed reinforced utility UNIT PRICE 82,984.00 78,075.00   

body and a 6,000 lb. corner mounted crane, complete, per specifications TOTAL 82,984.00 78,075.00 NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F550 Re Cab F5G 2015 Ford F550   

G. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 150 days 105-135 days   

Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Ancira Chrysler Jeep Dodge Freedom Chevrolet Park Cities Ford Lincoln  Demandstar

Autonation Chrysler Dodge Grande Ford Red McCombs Dodge SAWS Website

Bluebonnet Chrsler Dodge Grapevine Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep Red McCombs Toyota

Caldwell Country Ford Grayson Johnson Motors Reliable Chevrolet

Cavender Chevrolet Gulf States Toyota Sam Pack's Five Star Ford

Chapperral Dodge, Inc. Gunn Chevrolet Tom Benson Chevrolet

Dallas Dodge Henna Chevrolet Toyota of Boerne

Dodge Superstore Leif Johnson Ford
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